
9/7/2016 FSA16-VEH14.0 Cab & Chassis Trucks and Other 
Fleet Equipment

Pre-Award Bid Tabulation - Not Official Award 

Bid Listing 

Dealer Western Northern 

#1. OFF-ROAD ALL TERRAIN VEHICLES - 4 WHEEL DRIVE 

Honda Four Trax Foreman 500 (TRX500FA5H) 

GHC MOTORSPORTS $8,044.00 $7,899.00 

AMERI-RECREATIONAL SPORTS $8,180.00 $7,980.00 

Polaris Sportsman 570 EFI (A 17SEA57 A 1) 

GHC MOTORSPORTS $6,698.00 $6,575.00 

Yamaha Kodiac 700 (YFM70KDXHG) 

GHC MOTORSPORTS $6,850.00 $6,615.00 

AMERI-RECREATIONAL SPORTS $6,880.00 $6,680.00 

#2. OFF-ROAD UTILITY VEHICLES - 4 WHEEL DRIVE 

Honda Pioneer 700 (SXS700M2H) 

GHC MOTORSPORTS $10,200.00 $10,039.00 

AMERI-RECREATIONAL SPORTS $10,195.00 $10,099.00 

John Deere Gator HPX 

AG PRO COMPANIES LLC $9,150.00 $9,150.00 

Everglades Farm Equipment -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kawasaki Mule 4010 4X4 

AMERI-RECREATIONAL SPORTS $9,292.00 $9,092.00 

Kubota Diesel (RTVX900) 

R idge Equipment Co. $9,740.00 $9,550.00 

Creel Tractor Company -- No bid -- $10,845.00 

Coastal Machinery Company $10,801.00 -- No bid --

Futch's Tractor Depot $9,650.00 $9,600.00 

Polaris Ranger 570 EFI (R17RMA57A1) 

GHC MOTORSPORTS $9,875.00 $9,675.00 

Yamaha Viking (YXM70VDXHG) 

GHC MOTORSPORTS $11,257.00 $11,092.00 

AMERI-RECREATIONAL SPORTS $11,350.00 $11,150.00 

#3. ELECTRIC UTILITY VEHICLE 

Jacobsen Truckster EV 

Jacobsen, A Division of Textron $11,007.00 $11,007.00 

Polaris Ranger EV (R17RMAE4G8) 

GHC MOTORSPORTS $11,295.00 $11,270.00 

#4. 1 TON CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x2 

Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD (CC36003) 

Rountree-Moore Chevrolet, Cadillac $23,889.00 $23,350.00 

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $23,548.00 $23,148.00 

Ford F-350 (F3G) 
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Central Southern 

$7,742.00 $7,745.00 

$7,788.00 $7,772.00 

$6,488.00 $6,568.00 

$6,409.00 $6,412.00 

$6,480.00 $6,480.00 

$9,864.00 $9,874.00 

$9,899.00 $9,899.00 

-- No bid -- -- No bid --

$9,250.00 $9,250.00 

$8,888.00 $8,848.00 

$9,365.00 $9,689.00 

$10,692.00 $10,358.00 

-- No bid -- -- No bid --

$9,650.00 -- No bid --

$9,345.00 $9,465.00 

$10,932.00 $10,942.00 

$10,958.00 $10,958.00 

$11,007.00 $11,007.00 

$11,199.00 $11,239.00 

$23,367.00 $23,889.00 

$23,348.00 $24,186.00 
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9/7/2016 Florida Sheriffs Association's Vehicle Bid Award System - Bid Listing 

Jarrett Gordon Ford $24,064.00 -- No bid -- $24,064.00 -- No bid --

DUVAL FORD LLC $21,351.00 $21,351.00 $21,351.00 $21,351.00 

ALAN JAY FORD LINCOLN $23,583.00 $23,383.00 $22,883.00 $23,251.00 

HUB CITY FORD $22,899.00 $22,899.00 $22,999.00 $23,099.00 

GMC Sierra 3500 HD (TC36003) 

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $24,471.00 $23,971.00 $23,471.00 $24,471.00 

Gainesville Buick GMC $24,559.00 $24,069.00 $23,919.00 $24,569.00 

Ram 3500 (DD3L63) 

AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $24,410.00 $24,335.00 $24,375.00 $24,335.00 

Bay Dodge Chrysler Jeep RAM $25,352.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula $24,665.00 $24,565.00 $24,365.00 $24,565.00 

#5. 1 TON CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x4 

Chevrolet Silverado 3500 HD (CK36003) 

Rountree-Moore Chevrolet, Cadillac $26,158.00 $25,658.00 $25,658.00 $26,150.00 
Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $25,840.00 $25,440.00 $25,640.00 $26,478.00 

Ford F-350 (F3H) 

Jarrett Gordon Ford $27,741.00 -- No bid -- $27,741.00 -- No bid --

DUVAL FORD LLC $25,328.00 $25,328.00 $25,328.00 $25,328.00 

ALAN JAY FORD LINCOLN $27,568.00 $27,368.00 $26,868.00 $27,236.00 

HUB CITY FORD $26,899.00 $26,899.00 $26,999.00 $27,099.00 

GMC Sierra 3500 HD (TK36003) 

Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC Cadillac $26,762.00 $26,262.00 $25,762.00 $26,762.00 

Gainesville Buick GMC $26,898.00 $26,446.00 $26,246.00 $26,886.00 

Ram 3500 (DD8L63) 

AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $24,139.00 $24,064.00 $24,064.00 $24,064.00 

Bay Dodge Chrysler Jeep RAM $25,352.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula $24,353.00 $24,253.00 $24,053.00 $24,253.00 

#6. TILT CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x2 

Isuzu NF154 

Isuzu Truck of Ocala $36,799.00 $36,799.00 $36,799.00 $36,799.00 

Deland Truck Center, Inc. $37,582.00 $37,320.00 $37,320.00 $37,582.00 

Kenworth K270 

KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE $68,416.00 $68,166.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kenworth of Central Florida -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $70,969.00 -- No bid --

KENWORTH OF SOUTH FLORIDA -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $71,462.00 

Mitsubishi FE 130 

MESSINA TRUCK CENTER $36,499.00 $36,499.00 $36,499.00 $36,499.00 

Peterbi lt 220 

Rush Truck Center, Tampa $71,408.00 $71,408.00 $71,408.00 -- No bid --

Palm Peterbilt Truck Center Inc -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $75,029.00 

#7. 15,000 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x2 

Ford F-450 (F4G) 

Jarrett Gordon Ford $30,463.00 -- No bid -- $30,463.00 -- No bid --

DUVAL FORD LLC $35,043.00 $35,043.00 $35,043.00 $35,043.00 
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9/7/2016 Florida Sheriffs Association's Vehicle Bid Award System - Bid Listing 

ALAN JAY FORD LINCOLN $37,248.00 $37,048.00 $36,548.00 $36,916.00 

Palmetto Ford $33,800.00 $33,800.00 $33,800.00 $33,800.00 

HUB CITY FORD $37,599.00 $37,599.00 $37,699.00 $37,799.00 

Ram 4500 (DP4L63) 

AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $37,423.00 $37,348.00 $37,348.00 $37,348.00 

Bay Dodge Chrysler Jeep RAM $30,389.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula $37,575.00 $37,457.00 $37,275.00 $37,475.00 

#8. 15,000 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x4 

Ford F-450 (F4H) 

Jarrett Gordon Ford $33,022.00 -- No bid -- $33,022.00 -- No bid --

DUVAL FORD LLC $37,911.00 $37,911.00 $37,911.00 $37,911.00 

ALAN JAY FORD LINCOLN $40,077.00 $39,877.00 $39,377.00 $39,745.00 

Palmetto Ford $36,675.00 $36,675.00 $36,675.00 $36,675.00 

HUB CITY FORD $39,099.00 $39,099.00 $39,199.00 $39,299.00 

Ram 4500 (DP9L63) 

AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $40,069.00 $39,994.00 $39,994.00 $39,994.00 

Bay Dodge Chrysler Jeep RAM $32,125.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula $40,237.00 $40,137.00 $39,937.00 $40,137.00 

#9. 17,501 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x2 

Ford F-550 (F5G) 

Jarrett Gordon Ford $31,431.00 -- No bid -- $31,431.00 -- No bid --

DUVAL FORD LLC $36,011.00 $36,011.00 $36,011.00 $36,011.00 

ALAN JAY FORD LINCOLN $38,168.00 $37,968.00 $37,468.00 $37,836.00 

Palmetto Ford $34,775.00 $34,775.00 $34,775.00 $34,775.00 

HUB CITY FORD $37,199.00 $37,199.00 $37,299.00 $37,399.00 

Kenworth T170 

KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE $65,784.00 $65,534.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kenworth of Central Florida -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $67,950.00 -- No bid --

KENWORTH OF SOUTH FLORIDA -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $66,350.00 

Peterbilt 325 

Rush Truck Center, Tampa $66,101.00 $66,101.00 $66,101.00 -- No bid --

Palm Peterbilt Truck Center Inc -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $65,034.00 

Ram 5500 (DP5L63) 

AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $39,579.00 $39,499.00 $39,499.00 $39,499.00 

Bay Dodge Chrysler Jeep RAM $30,230.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula $39,640.00 $39,540.00 $39,340.00 $39,540.00 

#10. 17,501 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x4 

Ford F-550 (F5H) 

Jarrett Gordon Ford $33,999.00 -- No bid -- $33,399.00 -- No bid --

DUVAL FORD LLC $38,888.00 $38,888.00 $38,888.00 $38,888.00 

ALAN JAY FORD LINCOLN $41,147.00 $40,947.00 $40,447.00 $40,815.00 

Palmetto Ford $37,650.00 $37,650.00 $37,650.00 $37,650.00 

HUB CITY FORD $39,999.00 $39,999.00 $40,099.00 $40,199.00 

Ram 5500 (DPOL63) 

AutoNation CDJR Pembroke Pines $40,524.00 $40,449.00 $40,449.00 $40,449.00 
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9/7/2016 Florida Sheriffs Association's Vehicle Bid Award System - Bid Listing 

Bay Dodge Chrysler Jeep RAM $32,666.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Alan Jay Chrysler Jeep Dodge of Wauchula $40,712.00 $40,612.00 $40,412.00 $40,612.00 

#11. 25,500 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x2 

Hino 268A 

Rush Truck Center, Tampa $60,969.00 $60,969.00 $60,969.00 $60,969.00 

Ford F-650 (F6D) 

DUVAL FORD LLC $48,711.00 $48,711.00 $49,411.00 $49,411.00 

Palmetto Ford $47,250.00 $47,250.00 $47,250.00 $47,250.00 

HUB CITY FORD $50,999.00 $50,999.00 $50,199.00 $50,299.00 

Freightliner M2 

Orlando Freightliner $50,685.00 $50,685.00 $50,685.00 $50,685.00 

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner $53,697.00 $53,697.00 $53,697.00 $53,697.00 

International Durastar 

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $58,611.00 

Maudlin International Trucks LLC $60,400.00 $59,400.00 $59,400.00 -- No bid --

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $58,995.00 -- No bid --

Kenworth T270 

KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE $67,864.00 $67,614.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kenworth of Central Florida -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $68,680.00 -- No bid --

KENWORTH OF SOUTH FLORIDA -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $68,290.00 

Peterbilt 330 

Rush Truck Center, Tampa $73,003.00 $73,003.00 $73,003.00 -- No bid --

Palm Peterbilt Truck Center Inc -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $71,879.00 

#12. 30,000 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS (Dual Rear Wheel) - 4x2 

Hino 338 

Rush Truck Center, Tampa $61,940.00 $61,940.00 $61,940.00 $61,940.00 

Ford F-750 (F7D) 

DUVAL FORD LLC $49,480.00 $49,480.00 $49,978.00 $49,978.00 

Palmetto Ford $47,250.00 $47,250.00 $47,250.00 $47,250.00 

HUB CITY FORD $52,996.00 $52,996.00 $52,996.00 $52,996.00 

Freightliner M2 

Orlando Freightliner $39,720.00 $39,720.00 $39,720.00 $39,720.00 

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner $39,967.00 $39,967.00 $39,967.00 $39,967.00 

International Durastar 

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $59,263.00 

Maudlin International Trucks LLC $61,230.00 $60,230.00 $60,230.00 -- No bid --

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $59,945.00 -- No bid --

Kenworth T370 

KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE $67,972.00 $67,722.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kenworth of Central Florida -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $68,972.00 -- No bid --

KENWORTH OF SOUTH FLORIDA -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $67,408.00 

Peterbilt 337 

Rush Truck Center, Tampa $69,980.00 $69,980.00 $69,980.00 -- No bid --

Palm Peterbilt Truck Center Inc -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $70,809.00 
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9/7/2016 Florida Sheriffs Association's Vehicle Bid Award System - Bid Listing 

Western Star 4700 

Tampa Truck Center $76,783.00 $76,783.00 $76,783.00 $76,783.00 

#13. 52,000 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4x6 TANDEM AXLE TRACTOR (Only) 

Freightliner M2-112 

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner $77,697.00 $77,967.00 $77,967.00 $77,967.00 

International HX 

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $103,765.00 

Maudlin International Trucks LLC $104,250.00 $103,250.00 $103,250.00 -- No bid --

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $102,785.00 -- No bid --

International Work.star 

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $89,168.00 

Maudlin International Trucks LLC $90,875.00 $89,875.00 $89,875.00 -- No bid --

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $89,250.00 -- No bid --

Kenworth T880 

KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE $103,192.00 $102,942.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kenworth of Central Florida -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $103,995.00 -- No bid --

KENWORTH OF SOUTH FLORIDA -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $103,429.00 

Mack C or G Series 

NEXTRAN TRUCK CENTERS $99,190.00 $99,190.00 $99,190.00 $99,190.00 

Peterbi lt 56 7 

Rush Truck Center, Tampa $104,721.00 $104,721.00 $104,721.00 -- No bid --

Palm Peterbilt Truck Center Inc -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $114,494.00 

Volvo V Series 

General GMC Trucks Inc. $93,169.00 $93,169.00 $91,169.00 $91,169.00 

NEXTRAN TRUCK CENTERS $92,406.00 $92,406.00 $92,406.00 $92,406.00 

Western Star 4800 

Tampa Truck Center $96,187.00 $96,187.00 $96,187.00 $96,187.00 

#14. 52,000 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4x6 TANDEM AXLE TRUCK 

Freightliner M2-112 

Orlando Freightliner $66,284.00 $66,284.00 $66,284.00 $66,284.00 

Lou Bachrodt Freightliner $60,697.00 $60,967.00 $60,967.00 $60,967.00 

International HX 

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $101,600.00 

Maudlin International Trucks LLC $101,500.00 $100,500.00 $100,500.00 -- No bid --

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $99,985.00 -- No bid --

International Work.star 

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $88,453.00 

Maudlin International Trucks LLC $90,975.00 $89,975.00 $89,975.00 -- No bid --

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $89,750.00 -- No bid --

Kenworth T880 

KENWORTH OF JACKSONVILLE $101,836.00 $101,586.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Kenworth of Central Florida -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $102,475.00 -- No bid --

KENWORTH OF SOUTH FLORIDA -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $100,305.00 

Mack C or G Series 
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NEXTRAN TRUCK CENTERS $110,602.00 $110,602.00 $110,602.00 $110,602.00 

Peterbilt 56 7 

Rush Truck Center, Tampa $103,657.50 $103,657.50 $103,657.50 -- No bid --

Palm Peterbilt Truck Center Inc -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $111,898.00 

Volvo V Series 

General GMC Trucks Inc. $93,359.00 $93,359.00 $93,359.00 $91,359.00 

NEXTRAN TRUCK CENTERS $91,756.00 $91,756.00 $91,756.00 $91,756.00 

Western Star 4700 

Tampa Truck Center $86,463.00 $86,463.00 $86,463.00 $86,463.00 

#15. 60,000 lb. GVWR CAB & CHASSIS - 4x6 TANDEM AXLE REFUSE TRUCK (Only) 

Autocar ACX64 

General GMC Trucks Inc. $150,987.00 $150,987.00 -- No bid -- $148,987.00 

Kenworth of Central Florida $156,442.00 $156,341.00 $155,938.00 -- No bid --

Palmetto Ford $142,480.00 $143,480.00 -- No bid -- $138,850.00 

Crane Carrier LET2 

Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. $174,778.00 $174,778.00 $174,778.00 $174,778.00 

Mack MR Series 

NEXTRAN TRUCK CENTERS $139,018.00 $139,018.00 $139,018.00 $139,018.00 

Peterbilt 320 -520 

Rush Truck Center, Tampa $131,929.00 $131,929.00 $131,929.00 -- No bid --

Palm Peterbilt Truck Center Inc -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $133,007.00 

#16. 15 ft. FLEX WING ROTARY MOWER - PTO DRIVEN 

Alamo Eagle 15 

ALAMO INDUSTRIAL $17,964.00 $17,964.00 $17,964.00 $17,964.00 

Bush Hog 3815 

Creel Tractor Company -- No bid -- $16,540.00 $15,990.00 $15,843.00 

AG PRO COMPANIES LLC $15,700.00 $15,700.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Everglades Farm Equipment -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $15,095.00 $15,095.00 

John Deere HX15 

AG PRO COMPANIES LLC $15,900.00 $15,900.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Everglades Farm Equipment -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $16,250.00 $16,250.00 

Landpride Batwing (RC5615) 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $14,310.00 $14,310.00 

Creel Tractor Company -- No bid -- $15,210.00 $14,750.00 $14,375.00 

Futch's Tractor Depot $13,900.00 $13,900.00 $13,900.00 -- No bid --

Rhino 4150 

Glade & Grove Supply Co LLC -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $14,670.00 $14,670.00 

Everglades Farm Equipment -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $13,800.00 $13,800.00 

Schulte FX-1800 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $15,995.00 $15,995.00 

Glade & Grove Supply Co LLC -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $16,420.00 $16,420.00 

Everglades Farm Equipment -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $14,690.00 $14,690.00 

#17. ZERO TURN RADIUS COMMERCIAL GRADE MOWER 

Bad Boy Outlaw 6100 
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Bad Boy Inc. $7,512.00 $7,512.00 $7,512.00 $7,512.00 

Dixie Chopper 2760 EFI 

GHC MOTORSPORTS $8,596.00 $8,421.00 $8,271.00 $8,296.00 

Dixie Chopper $8,719.20 $8,719.20 $8,719.20 $8,719.20 

John Deere Z930M 

AG PRO COMPANIES LLC $7,950.00 $7,950.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Everglades Farm Equipment -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $8,375.00 $8,375.00 

Grasshopper (22561) 

Moridge Manufacturing, Inc. $8,197.00 $8,197.00 $8,197.00 $8,197.00 

Gravely Proturn 260 

Futch's Tractor Depot $7,819.00 $7,819.00 $7,819.00 -- No bid --

Kubota Z725KH-60 

Ridge Equipment Co. $6,836.00 $6,536.00 $6,536.00 $6,536.00 

Creel Tractor Company -- No bid -- $7,390.00 $7,140.00 $6,850.00 

Coastal Machinery Company $7,643.41 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Futch's Tractor Depot $6,913.00 $6,913.00 $6,913.00 -- No bid --

#18. REMOTE CONTROLLED BRUSH MOWER 

Alamo Ridgerunner 

ALAMO INDUSTRIAL $44,598.00 $44,598.00 $44,598.00 $44,598.00 

#19. 15 FT. DECK, LARGE DIESEL RIDE-ON INDUSTRIAL WIDE AREA MOWER 

Jacobsen HR-800 

Jacobsen, A Division of Textron $81,400.00 $81,400.00 $81,400.00 $81,400.00 

#20. COMPACT CENTER ARTICULATING TRACTOR - AWD 

Ventrac 3400 Series 

VENTURE PRODUCTS INC $12,889.05 $12,889.05 $12,889.05 $12,889.05 

Ventrac 4500 Series 

VENTURE PRODUCTS INC $17,391.30 $17,391.30 $17,391.30 $17,391.30 

#21. SMALL AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR (4 Wheel Drive) 

Case IH Farmall 35C 

Glade & Grove Supply Co LLC $18,400.00 $18,100.00 $17,860.00 $17,860.00 

John Deere 4105 

AG PRO COMPANIES LLC $19,650.00 $19,650.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Everglades Farm Equipment -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $19,950.00 $19,950.00 

Kubota L3901 DT 

Ridge Equipment Co. $15,662.00 $15,379.00 $15,290.00 $15,562.00 

Creel Tractor Company -- No bid -- $16,700.00 $16,350.00 $15,948.00 

Coastal Machinery Company $16,886.74 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Futch's Tractor Depot $15,600.00 $15,250.00 $15,250.00 -- No bid --

Mahindra 1538 

Mahindra USA $22,239.00 $22,239.00 $22,239.00 $22,239.00 

Massey Ferguson 1742 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $22,600.00 $22,600.00 

New Holland Boomer 37 

Creel Tractor Company -- No bid -- $17,888.00 $17,340.00 $16,988.00 
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#22. AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR (2 Wheel Drive) 

Case IH Farmall 1 OOC 

Glade & Grove Supply Co LLC $38,880.00 $38,850.00 $38,330.00 

Challenger MT455 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Ring Power Corporaton $82,572.00 $82,572.00 $82,572.00 

John Deere 51 OOM 

AG PRO COMPANIES LLC $38,700.00 $38,700.00 -- No bid --

Everglades Farm Equipment -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $40,500.00 

Kubota M5-091 

Ridge Equipment Co. $30,680.00 $30,480.00 $30,480.00 

Creel Tractor Company -- No bid -- $32,688.00 $32,188.00 

Coastal Machinery Company $34,504.34 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Futch's Tractor Depot $30,750.00 $30,550.00 $30,550.00 

Massey Ferguson 4610-M 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $42,912.00 

New Holland T4.100 

Creel Tractor Company $39,588.00 $39,388.00 $38,688.00 

#23. AGRICULTURE TYPE TRACTOR WITH BOOM MOWER (4 Wheel Drive) 

Case IH Maxxum 115 with Motrim Boom Mower 

Glade & Grove Supply Co LLC $108,850.00 $108,550.00 

Challenger MT 465 with Diamond Boom Mower 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Ring Power Corporaton $135,739.00 $135,739.00 

John Deere 6120M Alamo Industrial Mower 

ALAMO INDUSTRIAL $128,737.00 $128,737.00 

John Deere 6120M with Tiger Bengal Boom Mower 

Nortrax, Inc. $134,230.00 $134,230.00 

Kubota M6-131 with Terrain King Boom Mower 

TERRAi N Kl NG $140,960.00 $140,960.00 

Massey Ferguson 5613 with Diamond Boom Mower 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid --

New Holland TS6. 130 Alamo Industrial Mower 

ALAMO INDUSTRIAL $115,060.00 $115,060.00 

New Holland TS6. 230 with Tiger Bengal Boom Mower 

Nortrax, Inc. $128,260.00 $128,260.00 

#24. LARGE, DIESEL RIDE-ON INDUSTRIAL TOOL CARRIER 

MowerMax Industrial Tool Carrier 

ATMAX Equipment Co. $107,500.00 $107,500.00 

#25. 4X4 LOADER BACKHOE WITH CANOPY (STANDARD STICK) 

Case 580 SN 

Trekker Tractor, LLC 

Caterpillar 416 

$68,115.00 
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$68, 115.00 

$108,300.00 

-- No bid --

$135,739.00 

$128,737.00 

$134,230.00 

$140,960.00 

$133,136.00 

$115,060.00 

$128,260.00 

$107,500.00 

$68, 115.00 

$38,330.00 

$85,313.00 

-- No bid --

-- No bid --

$40,500.00 

$30,680.00 

$31,988.00 

-- No bid --

-- No bid --

$42,912.00 

$38,288.00 

$108,300.00 

$135,945.00 

-- No bid --

$128,737.00 

$134,230.00 

$140,960.00 

$133, 136.00 

$115,060.00 

$128,260.00 

$107,500.00 

$68,115.00 
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Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Ring Power Corporaton $67,061.00 $67,061.00 $67,061.00 

John Deere 31 OSL 

Nortrax, Inc. $65,799.00 $65,799.00 $65,799.00 

#26. SKID STEER LOADER - 1850 LB OPERATING CAPACITY WHEELED ONLY 

Bobcat S570 

Clark Equipment Company dba Bobcat Company $28,747.00 $28,747.00 $28,747.00 

Case SV185 

Trekker Tractor, LLC $31,109.00 $31,109.00 $31,109.00 

Caterpillar 236D 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Ring Power Corporaton $32,403.00 $32,403.00 $32,403.00 

John Deere 31 BG 

Nortrax, Inc. $28,345.00 $28,345.00 $28,345.00 

Kubota SSV65 

Ridge Equipment Co. $35,950.00 $35,550.00 $35,250.00 

Creel Tractor Company -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $31,080.00 

Coastal Machinery Company $31,508.55 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Futch's Tractor Depot $29,200.00 $28,300.00 $28,300.00 

Takeuchi TS60V 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $35,000.00 $35,000.00 

Terex V230S 

Coastal Machinery Company $33,974.72 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Volvo MC95C 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $30,500.00 $30,500.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $27,725.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Wacker Neuson SW24 

Wacker Neuson Sales Americas LLC $39,350.00 $39,350.00 $39,350.00 

#27. SKID STEER LOADER - 2800 LBS OPERATING CAPACITY WHEELED ONLY 

Bobcat S750 

Clark Equipment Company dba Bobcat Company $42,432.00 $42,432.00 $42,432.00 

Case SV300 

Trekker Tractor, LLC $43,652.00 $43,652.00 $43,652.00 

Caterpillar 272D 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Ring Power Corporaton $46,598.00 $46,598.00 $46,598.00 

John Deere 330G 

Nortrax, Inc. $41,950.00 $41,950.00 $41,950.00 

Wacker Neuson SW28 

Wacker Neuson Sales Americas LLC $39,895.00 $39,895.00 $39,895.00 

#28. SKID STEER LOADER - 3100 LBS. OPERATING CAPACITY TRACKED ONLY 

Bobcat T750 

Clark Equipment Company dba Bobcat Company 

Case TR310 

$51,064.00 
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$51,064.00 $51,064.00 

$66,530.00 

-- No bid --

$65,799.00 

$28,747.00 

$31,109.00 

$31,516.00 

-- No bid --

$28,345.00 

$35,250.00 

$30,650.00 

-- No bid --

-- No bid --

$35,000.00 

-- No bid --

$30,500.00 

-- No bid --

$39,350.00 

$42,432.00 

$43,652.00 

$45,254.00 

-- No bid --

$41,950.00 

$39,895.00 

$51,064.00 
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Trekker Tractor, LLC $41,119.00 $41,119.00 $41,119.00 $41,119.00 

Caterpillar 279D 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $51,268.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $51,653.00 $51,653.00 $51,653.00 -- No bid --

John Deere 331G 

Nortrax, Inc. $54,725.00 $54,725.00 $54,725.00 $54,725.00 

Kubota SVL75-2 

Ridge Equipment Co. $41,450.00 $41,200.00 $41,200.00 $41,450.00 

Creel Tractor Company -- No bid -- $41,638.00 $40,957.00 $40,188.00 

Coastal Machinery Company $41,982.54 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Futch's Tractor Depot $39,550.00 $39,350.00 $39,350.00 -- No bid --

Takeuchi TL 12 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $65,878.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Volvo MCT135C 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $51,650.00 $51,650.00 $51,650.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $51,546.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Wacker Neuson ST35 

Wacker Neuson Sales Americas LLC $50,250.00 $50,250.00 $50,250.00 $50,250.00 

#29. THE "ROOK" TACTICAL VEHICLE 

Caterpillar 287 with Rook Option 

Ring Power Corporaton $292,600.00 $292,600.00 $292,600.00 $292,600.00 

#30. 1. 5 CU. YD. WHEEL LOADER (Z-BAR LINKAGE BUCKET - PARALLEL ARM OPTION) 

Caterpillar 908M 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $81,983.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $82,831.00 $82,831.00 $82,831.00 -- No bid --

John Deere 324K 

Everglades Farm Equipment $87,500.00 $87,500.00 $87,500.00 $87,500.00 

Kawasaki 602 

G S Equipment, Inc. $91,120.00 $91,120.00 $91,120.00 $91,120.00 

Volvo L45G 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $97,300.00 $97,300.00 $97,300.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $96,949.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Takeuchi TWBO 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $81,796.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Wacker Neuson WL60 

Wacker Neuson Sales Americas LLC $82,220.00 $82,220.00 $82,220.00 $82,220.00 

#31. 3.0 CU. YD. WHEEL LOADER (Z-BAR LINKAGE BUCKET - PARALLEL ARM OPTION) 

Case 621 F 

Trekker Tractor, LLC 

Caterpillar 926 M 

Kelly Tractor Co 

Ring Power Corporaton 

$124,775.00 

-- No bid -­

$129, 722.00 
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$124,775.00 

-- No bid -­

$129, 722.00 

$124,775.00 

-- No bid -­

$129,722.00 

$124,775.00 

$128,092.00 

-- No bid --
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Doosan DL220-5 

Doosan lnfracore Construction Equipment 
$119,545.48 $119,545.48 $119,545.48 $119,545.48 

America 

Hyundai HL940 

Lyle Machinery Company $109,820.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Trekker Tractor, LLC -- No bid -- $117,333.00 $117,333.00 $117,333.00 

John Deere 524K 

Nortrax, Inc. $116,700.00 $116,700.00 $116,700.00 $116,700.00 

Kawasaki 7027 

G S Equipment, Inc. $138,470.00 $138,470.00 $138,470.00 $138,470.00 

Volvo L60H 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $124,000.00 $124,000.00 $124,000.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $123,868.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#32. 5. 75 CU. YD. WHEEL LOADER (Z-BAR LINKAGE BUCKET) 

Case 1021 F 

Trekker Tractor, LLC $250,574.00 $250,574.00 $250,574.00 $250,574.00 

Caterpillar 972M 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $390,096.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $387,931.00 $387,931.00 $387,931.00 -- No bid --

Doosan DL450-5 

Doosan lnfracore Construction Equipment 
$277,828.19 $277,828.19 $277,828.19 $277,828.19 

America 

Hyundai HL980 

Lyle Machinery Company $275,160.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Trekker Tractor, LLC -- No bid -- $284,846.00 $284,846.00 $284,846.00 

John Deere 7 44K 

Nortrax, Inc. $302,499.00 $302,499.00 $302,499.00 $302,499.00 

Kawasaki 9227 

G S Equipment, Inc. $282,097.00 $282,097.00 $282,097.00 $282,097.00 

Volvo L150H 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. 
-- No bid -- $305,000.00 $305,000.00 $305,000.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $304,995.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#33. MOTOR GRADER - SMALL 

LBP G-700 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $172,463.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Lee Boy 685B 

Ring Power Corporaton $163,798.00 $163,798.00 $163,798.00 $163,798.00 

Mauldin MG618 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $151,988.00 $151,988.00 

Noram 65E Grader 

Nortrax, Inc. $153,500.00 $153,500.00 $153,500.00 $153,500.00 

#34. MOTORGRADER 

Case 845B 
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9/7/2016 

Trekker Tractor, LLC 

Caterpillar 120M 

Kelly Tractor Co 

Ring Power Corporaton 

John Deere 6 70G

Florida Sheriffs Association's Vehicle Bid Award System - Bid Listing 

$179,770.00 

-- No bid -­

$185,270.00 

$179,770.00 

-- No bid -­

$185,270.00 

$179,770.00 

-- No bid -­

$185,270.00 

$179,770.00 

$193,479.00 

-- No bid --

Nortrax, Inc. $196,300.00 $196,300.00 $196,300.00 $196,300.00 

#35. 70 HP BULLDOZER CANOPY TRACTOR (Standard Track - Wide Track Optional) 

Case 650L 

Trekker Tractor, LLC $76,373.00 $76,373.00 $76,373.00 $76,373.00 

Caterpillar D3 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $76,400.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $78,791.00 $78,791.00 $78,791.00 -- No bid --

John Deere 450J 

Nortrax, Inc. $71,400.00 $71,400.00 $71,400.00 $71,400.00 

#36. 90 HP BULLDOZER CANOPY TRACTOR (Standard Track - Wide Track Optional) 

Case 850M 

Trekker Tractor, LLC $102,158.00 

Caterpillar D4 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid --

Ring Power Corporaton $94,944.00 

John Deere 650K 

Nortrax, Inc. $109,150.00 

#37. 180 HP BULLDOZER CANOPY TRACTOR 

Case 2050M 

Trekker Tractor, LLC 

Caterpillar D6 T 

Kelly Tractor Co 

Ring Power Corporaton 

John Deere 850K 

$262,920.00 

-- No bid -­

$332, 325.00 

Nortrax, Inc. $273,300.00 

#38. ALL TERRAIN WALKING EXCAVATOR 

Kaiser S2 

G S Equipment, Inc. 

Menzi Muck M3 

$284,939.00 

$102, 158.00 

-- No bid --

$94,944.00 

$109,150.00 

$262,920.00 

-- No bid -­

$332,325.00 

$273,300.00 

$284,939.00 

$102,158.00 

-- No bid --

$94,944.00 

$109,150.00 

$262,920.00 

-- No bid -­

$332,325.00 

$273,300.00 

$284,939.00 

Menzi USA Sales, Inc. $254,235.00 $254,235.00 $254,235.00 

#39. HYDRAULIC MINI EXCAVATOR - 7,105 lb. OPERATING WEIGHT 

Bobcat E32 

Clark Equipment Company dba Bobcat Company 

Case CX36B 

Trekker Tractor, LLC 

Caterpillar 303E CR 

Kelly Tractor Co 

Ring Power Corporaton 

$35,743.00 

$35,694.00 

-- No bid -­

$36, 126.00 
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$35,743.00 

$35,694.00 

-- No bid --

$36,126.00 

$35,743.00 

$35,694.00 

-- No bid --

$36,126.00 

$102,158.00 

$92,450.00 

-- No bid --

$109,150.00 

$262,920.00 

$301,955.00 

-- No bid --

$273,300.00 

$284,939.00 

$254,235.00 

$35,743.00 

$35,694.00 

$35,200.00 

-- No bid --
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Hitachi ZX35-U-5 

Nortrax, Inc. $38,295.00 $38,295.00 $38,295.00 $38,295.00 

Hyundai R35Z-9A 

Lyle Machinery Company $32,210.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Trekker Tractor, LLC 
-- No bid -- $32,800.00 $32,800.00 $32,800.00 

John Deere 35G 

Everglades Farm Equipment $38,700.00 $38,700.00 $38,700.00 $38,700.00 

Kobelco SK35SR 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $33,961.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

GS Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $34,014.00 $34,014.00 $34,014.00 

Kubota U35-4 

Ridge Equipment Co. $33,917.00 $33,417.00 $33,417.00 $33,717.00 

Creel Tractor Company -- No bid -- $31,902.00 $31,290.00 $30,902.00 

Coastal Machinery Company $32,681.59 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Futch's Tractor Depot $31,250.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00 -- No bid --

Takeuchi TB240 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $44,350.00 $44,350.00 $44,350.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $44,265.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Volvo EC 35 D 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $35,700.00 $35,700.00 $35,700.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $37,831.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Wacker Neuson 3503 

Wacker Neuson Sales Americas LLC $40,695.00 $40,695.00 $40,695.00 $40,695.00 

#40. HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR - 15,590 lb. OPERATING WEIGHT 

Bobcat E85 

Clark Equipment Company dba Bobcat Company $82,775.40 $82,775.40 $82,775.40 $82,775.40 

Case CX75C 

Trekker Tractor, LLC $81,750.00 $81,750.00 $81,750.00 $81,750.00 

Caterpillar 308E2 

Kelly Tractor Co 
-- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $89,770.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $93,396.00 $93,396.00 $93,396.00 -- No bid --

Doosan DX85R-3 

Doosan lnfracore Construction Equipment 
$82,950.32 $82,950.32 $82,950.32 $82,950.32 

America 

Hitachi ZX75US-5 

Nortrax, Inc. $84,650.00 $84,650.00 $84,650.00 $84,650.00 

Hyundai R80CR-9A 

Lyle Machinery Company $80,150.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Trekker Tractor, LLC -- No bid -- $78,637.00 $78,637.00 $78,637.00 

John Deere 75G 

Nortrax, Inc. $84,650.00 $84,650.00 $84,650.00 $84,650.00 

Kobelco SK-75SR-3E 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $75,431.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $79,615.00 $79,615.00 $79,615.00 
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Kubota KXOS0-4 

Ridge Equipment Co. $75,475.00 $74,950.00 $74,950.00 $75,225.00 

Creel Tractor Company -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $75,688.00 $74,888.00 

Coastal Machinery Company $78,582.03 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Futch's Tractor Depot -- No bid -- $73,664.00 $73,664.00 -- No bid --

Link-Belt 75MSR 

G S Equipment, Inc. $78,525.00 $78,525.00 $78,525.00 $78,525.00 

Takeuchi TB290 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $91,000.00 $91,000.00 $91,000.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $90,732.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Volvo ECR88D 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $82,000.00 $82,000.00 $82,000.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $85,435.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Wacker Neuson ET90 

Wacker Neuson Sales Americas LLC $88,950.00 $88,950.00 $88,950.00 $88,950.00 

#41. HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR - 38,000 LB OPERATING WEIGHT 

Case CX160D 

Trekker Tractor, LLC $132,100.00 $132,100.00 $132,100.00 $132,100.00 

Caterpillar 316F 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $160,667.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $159,860.00 $159,860.00 $159,860.00 -- No bid --

Doosan DX1 SOLC-5 

Doosan lnfracore Construction Equipment 
$129,529.60 $129,529.60 $129,529.60 $129,529.60 

America 

Hitachi ZX160LC-5 

Nortrax, Inc. $141,990.00 $141,990.00 $141,990.00 $141,990.00 

Hyundai HX160L 

Lyle Machinery Company $117,530.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Trekker Tractor, LLC -- No bid -- $117, 100.00 $117,100.00 $117, 100.00 

John Deere 160GLC 

Nortrax, Inc. $141,990.00 $ 141 , 990. 00 $141,990.00 $141,990.00 

Kobelco SK170LC 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $137,535.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $129,431.00 $129,431.00 $129,431.00 

Link-Belt 160X3 

G S Equipment, Inc. $137,593.00 $137,593.00 $137,593.00 $137,593.00 

Volvo EC160EL 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $134,000.00 $134,000.00 $134,000.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $133,582.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#42. HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR - 76,550 LB OPERATING WEIGHT 

Case CX350D 

Trekker Tractor, LLC $266,700.00 $266,700.00 $266,700.00 $266,700.00 

Caterpillar 336F L 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $283,427.00 

https://veba.flsheriffs.org/index.cfrn?referer=bidDocument.bidAward&bidDocumentlD=55 14/23 

NO
T 

OFF
IC

IA
L 

AW
AR

D



9/7/2016 Florida Sheriffs Association's Vehicle Bid Award System - Bid Listing 

Ring Power Corporaton $282,654.00 $282,654.00 $282,654.00 

Doosan DX350LC-5 

Doosan lnfracore Construction Equipment 
$246,421.27 $246,421.27 $246,421.27 America 

Hitachi ZX350LC-5 

Nortrax, Inc. $261,400.00 $261,400.00 $261,400.00 

Hyundai HX380L 

Lyle Machinery Company $254,650.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Trekker Tractor, LLC -- No bid -- $253,000.00 $253,000.00 

John Deere 350GLC 

Nortrax, Inc. $261,400.00 $261,400.00 $261,400.00 

Kobelco SK 350 LC-9 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $241,523.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $239,120.00 $239,120.00 

Link-Belt 350X3 

G S Equipment, Inc. $266,667.00 $266,667.00 $266,667.00 

Volvo EC350 E 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $253,000.00 $253,000.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $250,925.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#43. HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR, WHEELED TYPE - 42,000 lb. OPERATING WEIGHT 

Caterpillar M318 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Ring Power Corporaton $207,844.00 $207,844.00 $207,844.00 

Doosan DX210WE-5 

Doosan lnfracore Construction Equipment 
$182,703.73 $182,703.73 $182,703.73 America 

Hyundai R21 OW-9A 

Lyle Machinery Company $176,820.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Trekker Tractor, LLC -- No bid -- $170,000.00 $170,000.00 

John Deere 190 GW 

Nortrax, Inc. $188,990.00 $188,990.00 $188,990.00 

Volvo EW 180E 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $187,000.00 $187,000.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $185,658.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#44. TELESCOPIC EXCAVATOR, TRACK TYPE - 45,000 lb. OPERATING WEIGHT 

Gradall 4200 Ill

G S Equipment, Inc. $289,707.00 $289,707.00 $289,707.00 

#45. TELESCOPIC EXCAVATOR, WHEELED 6x6 - 47,000 lb. OPERATING WEIGHT 

Gradal l XL 41 00 IV 

G S Equipment, Inc. $390,519.00 $390,519.00 

#46. COMPACTION VIBRATORY ROLLER (SINGLE DRUM) 30,000 LBS 

Bomag BW177D-5 

Nortrax, Inc. 

Case SV208 

$86,485.00 
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Trekker Tractor, LLC $72,680.00 $72,680.00 $72,680.00 $72,680.00 

Caterpillar CS44 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $101,840.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $101,210.00 $101,210.00 $101,210.00 -- No bid --

Hyundai HR140C-9 

Lyle Machinery Company $96,790.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Sakai SV540 

Coastal Machinery Company $111,330.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $116,516.00 $116,516.00 $116,516.00 

Volvo SD-75B 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $79,775.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Wacker Neuson RC70 

Wacker Neuson Sales Americas LLC $82,595.00 $82,595.00 $82,595.00 $82,595.00 

#47. 47" SMALL DOUBLE DRUM ROLLER - 5,400 LBS. 

Bomag BW120SL-5 

Nortrax, Inc. $34,350.00 $34,350.00 $34,350.00 $34,350.00 

Case DV26 

Trekker Tractor, LLC $33,849.00 $33,849.00 $33,849.00 $33,849.00 

Caterpillar CB24B 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $42,209.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $38,541.00 $38,541.00 $38,541.00 -- No bid --

Hyundai H R30T-9 

Lyle Machinery Company $38,190.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Volvo DD25B 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $34,385.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Wacker Neuson RD 27-120 

Wacker Neuson Sales Americas LLC $42,620.00 $42,620.00 $42,620.00 $42,620.00 

#48. 70" LARGE DOUBLE DRUM ROLLER - 22,000 LBS. 

Bomag BW190AD-5 

Nortrax, Inc. $128,800.00 $128,800.00 $128,800.00 $128,800.00 

Caterpillar CB54XW 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $125,973.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $134,391.00 $134,391.00 $134,391.00 -- No bid --

Sakai SW880 

Coastal Machinery Company $132,175.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

G S Equipment, Inc. -- No bid -- $141,184.00 $141, 184.00 $141, 184.00 

Volvo DD120B 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $120,500.00 $120,500.00 $120,500.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $120,233.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#49. TRAILER MOUNTED SEWER CLEANER 

Obrien 7018-SC 

Pat's Pump & Blower $54,420.00 $54,420.00 $54,420.00 $54,420.00 
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9/7/2016 Florida Sheriffs Association's Vehicle Bid Award System - Bid Listing 

Pipe Hunter 76418 

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales $45,592.00 $45,592.00 $45,592.00 

Vactor RamJet 4018 

Environmental Products of Florida Corp $62,404.00 $62,404.00 $62,404.00 

#50. VACUUM EXCAVATOR, TRAILER MOUNTED - 14,000 lb. GVWR 

PacificTek PV800 

Environmental Products of Florida Corp $111,036.00 $111,036.00 $111,036.00 

Pipe Hunter (Vac Hunter) 

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales $78,339.00 $78,339.00 $78,339.00 

Vermeer LP873SDT 

Vermeer Southeast $75,008.00 $75,008.00 $75,008.00 

X-Vac X800

Pat's Pump & Blower $95,605.00 $95,605.00 $95,605.00 

#51. 10 CUBIC YARD COMBINATION SEWER CLEANINGNACUUMING MACHINE 

Aquatech B-10 

Pat's Pump & Blower $189,125.00 $189,125.00 

Super Products Camel 1200 

Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. $199,845.00 $199,845.00 

Va call AJV 1 010 

G S Equipment, Inc. $179,128.00 $179,128.00 

Vac-Con 11 Yard 

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales $172,124.00 $172,124.00 

Vactor 2100 Plus 

Environmental Products of Florida Corp $226,075.00 $226,075.00 

#52. 3 WHEEL MECHANICAL BROOM STREET SWEEPER 

Elgin Pelican 

Environmental Products of Florida Corp $199,275.00 $199,275.00 

Global M3 

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales $173,229.00 $173,229.00 

#53. CABOVER MECHANICAL BROOM STREET SWEEPER 

Elgin Eagle 

Environmental Products of Florida Corp $277,414.00 $277,414.00 

Johnston ES351 

Pat's Pump & Blower $279,150.00 $279,150.00 

Schwarze M6 Avalanche 

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales $282,690.00 $282,690.00 

Stewart-Amos Starfire S-5 

G S Equipment, Inc. $263,125.00 $263,125.00 

#54. COMPACT SWEEPER - 2.3 CUBIC YARD AIR SWEEPER 

Johnston C201 

Pat's Pump & Blower $135,050.00 

#55. REGENERATIVE AIR STREET SWEEPER 

Elgin Crosswind (J Plus) 
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Environmental Products of Florida Corp $229,513.00 $229,513.00 $229,513.00 $229,513.00 

Johnston RT655 

Pat's Pump & Blower $229,360.00 $229,360.00 $229,360.00 $229,360.00 

Schwarze A7 Tornado 

Southern Sewer Equipment Sales $229,936.00 $229,936.00 $229,936.00 $229,936.00 

Stewart-Amos Galaxy R-8 

G S Equipment, Inc. $324,700.00 $324,700.00 $324,700.00 $324,700.00 

Tymco 600 

Container Systems & Equipment Co., Inc. $221,994.00 $221,994.00 $221,994.00 $221,994.00 

#56. SELF PROPELLED HYDROSTATIC BROOM - CENTER SLUNG 

Blaw-Knox CB-90 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $61,000.00 $61,000.00 $61,000.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $60,022.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Broce 350 Boom 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $55,391.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $52,192.00 $52,192.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#57. 7' x 16' ENCLOSED CARGO TRAILER- 7,000 lb. GVWR 

United U-716TA35-8.5 

Federal Contracts Corp $8,076.00 $8,076.00 $8,076.00 $8,076.00 

Wells Cargo CW1622-102 

Texas Trailers Sales and Service $7,750.00 $7,390.00 $7,520.00 $7,780.00 

#58. 8'6" x 25' DECK OVER FLATBED TRAILER - 16,000 LB GVWR 

All Steel TA8258T 

General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales, Inc. $7,890.00 $7,640.00 $7,740.00 $7,990.00 

Big Tex 22PH255 

Texas Trailers Sales and Service $9,040.00 $8,690.00 $8,790.00 $9,090.00 

Eager Beaver BB-DOW 

Trekker Tractor, LLC $10,800.00 $10,800.00 $10,800.00 $10,800.00 

Nortrax, Inc. $11,790.00 $11,790.00 $11,790.00 $11,790.00 

Econoline DP1025DE Tag Trailer 

Deland Truck Center, Inc. $8,710.00 $8,710.00 $8,710.00 $8,710.00 

Felling Trailers FT-16-2 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $11,800.00 

Coastal Machinery Company $11,607.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Federal Contracts Corp -- No bid -- $12,291.00 $12,291.00 -- No bid --

Interstate 16BST 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $11,050.00 $11,050.00 

Nortrax, Inc. $11,645.00 $11,645.00 $11,645.00 $11,645.00 

Texas Trailer TX85258T 

Texas Trailers Sales and Service $7,790.00 $7,440.00 $7,620.00 $7,860.00 

Towmaster TC-16 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $12,950.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $14,562.00 $14,562.00 $14,562.00 -- No bid --

Trail King TK20 
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Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $14,350.00 $14,350.00 $14,350.00 

XL Specialized Tailers XL 24 T 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $18,850.00 

SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS $18,650.00 $18,650.00 $18,650.00 -- No bid --

#59. 14,000 lb. GVWR PULL BEHIND DUMP TRAILER 

All Steel DT7147T-24 

General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales, Inc. $8,100.00 $7,850.00 $7,950.00 $8,200.00 

Big Tex 14LX 

Texas Trailers Sales and Service $7,690.00 $7,340.00 $7,460.00 $7,720.00 

Felling FT-12DT-HD 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $10,850.00 

Coastal Machinery Company $10,390.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

Federal Contracts Corp -- No bid -- $10,980.00 $10,980.00 -- No bid --

#60. 48' WASTE TRAILER WITH WALKING FLOOR 

Mac Trailer TNSP48MF 

Trucks & Parts of Tampa, Inc. $68,190.00 $68,190.00 $68,190.00 $68,190.00 

Travis Classic Walking Floor Trailer 

General Truck Equipment & Trailer Sales, Inc. $67,800.00 $69,400.00 $69,525.00 $69,900.00 

#61. ARTICULATED OFF ROAD DUMP TRUCK - 50,000 lb. PAYLOAD CAPACITY 

Caterpillar 725 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $317,796.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $313,642.00 $313,642.00 $313,642.00 -- No bid --

John Deere 250D-II 

Nortrax, Inc. $304,990.00 $304,990.00 $304,990.00 $304,990.00 

Terex TA300 

Trekker Tractor, LLC $371,778.00 $371,778.00 $371,778.00 $371,778.00 

Volvo A25G 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. -- No bid -- $332,000.00 $332,000.00 $332,000.00 

Cowin Equipment Company Inc. $331,863.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#62. 80,000 lb. LANDFILL COMPACTOR 

Bomag BC772RB-4 

Nortrax, Inc. $523,600.00 $523,600.00 $523,600.00 $523,600.00 

Caterpillar 826 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $568,865.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $562,869.00 $562,869.00 $562,869.00 -- No bid --

#63. BRUSH CHIPPER - TRAILER MOUNTED 

Bandit 1390XP 

Bandit Industries, Inc. $50,960.00 $50,960.00 $50,960.00 $50,960.00 

DuraTech TC-15 

Environmental Products of Florida Corp $41,526.00 $41,526.00 $41,526.00 $41,526.00 

Morbark M15RX 

Morbark, LLC $49,989.15 $49,989.15 $49,989.15 $49,989.15 

Vermeer BC1500 
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Vermeer Southeast $60,364.00 $60,364.00 $60,364.00 $60,364.00 

#64. SELF PROPELLED STUMP CUTTER 

Vermeer SC362 

Vermeer Southeast $19,084.00 $19,084.00 $19,084.00 $19,084.00 

Toro STX 38EFI 

Flagler Construction Equipment, LLC. 
-- No bid -- $23,000.00 $23,000.00 $23,000.00 

#65. WALK BEHIND TRENCHER 

Vermeer RTX250 

Vermeer Southeast $16,326.00 $16,326.00 $16,326.00 $16,326.00 

#66. CUSHION TIRE LIFT TRUCK - 4,000 lb. CAPACITY 

Caterpillar 2CC4000 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $19,500.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $26,629.00 $26,629.00 $26,629.00 -- No bid --

Hyster S40-FT 

Briggs Equipment Inc. $20,802.50 $20,802.50 $20,802.50 $20,802.50 

Mitsubishi FG25 

Ring Power Corporaton $27,870.00 $27,870.00 $27,870.00 -- No bid --

Toyota 8FGCU20 

Southern States Toyotalift $22,183.00 $22,183.00 $22,183.00 $22,183.00 

#67. SCISSOR LIFT - SELF PROPELLED 

Genie GS-1930 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $10,500.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $12,520.00 $12,520.00 $12,520.00 -- No bid --

Haulotte Optimum 1930 E 

Federal Contracts Corp $13,192.00 $13,192.00 $13,192.00 $13,192.00 

JLG 1930 ES 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $11,300.00 $11,300.00 

Ridge Equipment Co. $12,378.00 $11,978.00 $11,978.00 $12,178.00 

#68. LIGHT TOWER - TRAILER MOUNTED 

Doosan Lscwkub-60Hz 

Doosan lnfracore Portable Power $7,286.00 $7,286.00 $7,286.00 $7,286.00 

Generac MLT3060 

ACF Standby Systems $8,950.00 $8,950.00 $8,950.00 $8,950.00 

Multiquip MLTDA72 

Federal Contracts Corp $13,476.00 $13,476.00 $13,476.00 $13,476.00 

Wacker Neuson LTN 6L 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $8,796.00 $8,796.00 

Wacker Neuson Sales Americas LLC $8,799.00 $8,799.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#69. PORTABLE SECURITY TOWER 

Stamm ST-21 

Stamm Mfg - World Industrial Equipment $59,995.00 $59,995.00 $59,995.00 $59,995.00 

#70. 125KW GENERATOR PACKAGE 

AKSA ULJ-125 
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Zabatt Power Systems $30,870.00 $30,870.00 $30,870.00 $30,870.00 

Blue Star Power Systems JD125-02 

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc $28,800.00 $28,800.00 $28,800.00 $28,800.00 

Caterpillar D125-8 

Pantropic Power -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $41,000.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $40,618.00 $40,618.00 $40,618.00 -- No bid --

Doosan G150 WCU-3A-T4F 

Doosan lnfracore Portable Power $72,692.00 $72,692.00 $72,692.00 $72,692.00 

Generac SD 130 

ACF Standby Systems $33,300.00 $33,300.00 $33,300.00 $33,300.00 

Hi power HJW130T6U 

Hipower Systems $29,456.39 $29,456.39 $29,456.39 $29,456.39 

Tradewinds TP125 

Tradewinds Power Corp. $38,290.00 $38,290.00 $38,290.00 $38,290.00 

Wacker G150 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $83,278.00 $83,278.00 

Wacker Neuson Sales Americas LLC $87,810.00 $87,810.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#71. 150KW MOBILE GENERATOR PACKAGE 

AKSA AT150 

Zabatt Power Systems $48,450.00 $48,450.00 $48,450.00 $48,450.00 

Blue Star Power Systems JD150-01 Trailer 

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc $58,200.00 $58,200.00 $58,200.00 $58,200.00 

Doosan G190 WCU-34-T4F 

Doosan lnfracore Portable Power $85,076.00 $85,076.00 $85,076.00 $85,076.00 

Generac/Magnum MM.G175 

ACF Standby Systems $74,900.00 $74,900.00 $74,900.00 $74,900.00 

Hipower HRJW-175-T6 

Hipower Systems $55,548.48 $55,548.48 $55,548.48 $55,548.48 

Multiquip DCA 220SSJU4F 

Federal Contracts Corp $112,407.00 $112,407.00 $112,407.00 $112,407.00 

Tradewi nds TP 150 

Tradewinds Power Corp. $58,850.00 $58,850.00 $58,850.00 $58,850.00 

Wacker G180 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $100,490.00 $100,490.00 

Wacker Neuson Sales Americas LLC $95,275.00 $95,275.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#72. 500kW GENERATOR PACKAGE 

AKSA APD-ULJ500 

Zabatt Power Systems $86,040.00 $86,040.00 $86,040.00 $86,040.00 

Blue Star Generator (VD500-01) 

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc $81,400.00 $81,400.00 $81,400.00 $81,400.00 

Caterpillar 15 ACERT 

Pantropic Power -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $121,500.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $121,385.00 $121,385.00 $121,385.00 -- No bid --

Generac SD500 
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ACF Standby Systems $89,100.00 $89,100.00 $89,100.00 $89,100.00 

Hipower Generator (HMW 510 T6) 

Hipower Systems $79,281.80 $79,281.80 $79,281.80 $79,281.80 

Tradewinds TP500 

Tradewinds Power Corp. $102,752.00 $102,752.00 $102,752.00 $102,752.00 

#73. 500kW MOBILE GENERATOR PACKAGE 

Blue Star Generator (VD500-01 Trailer) 

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc $127,700.00 $127,700.00 $127,700.00 $127,700.00 

Caterpillar 500 kW (XQ570) 

Pantropic Power -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $275,000.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $274,720.00 $274,720.00 $274,720.00 -- No bid --

Hipower Generator (HRMW 580 T6) 

Hipower Systems $134,102.63 $134,102.63 $134,102.63 $134,102.63 

Generac Magnum (MMG625VT2) 

ACF Standby Systems $139,800.00 $139,800.00 $139,800.00 $139,800.00 

Multi Quip Generator (DCA600SSVC) 

Federal Contracts Corp $196,758.00 $196,758.00 $196,758.00 $196,758.00 

Tradewinds TP500 

Tradewinds Power Corp. $143,903.00 $143,903.00 $143,903.00 $143,903.00 

#7 4. 600 AMP AUTOMATIC TRANSFER SWITCH 

ASCO Series 300 

Mid Florida Diesel, Inc $4,270.00 $4,270.00 $4,270.00 $4,270.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $4,320.00 $4,320.00 $4,320.00 -- No bid --

AKSA 300 Series 

Zabatt Power Systems $5,002.00 $5,002.00 $5,002.00 $5,002.00 

Caterpillar CTG Series 

Pantropic Power -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- $5,500.00 

Ring Power Corporaton $5,100.00 $5,100.00 $5,100.00 -- No bid --

GE Zenith ZTG600 

ACF Standby Systems $6,850.00 $6,850.00 $6,850.00 $6,850.00 

Generac GTS600 

ACF Standby Systems $6,790.00 $6,790.00 $6,790.00 $6,790.00 

Tradewinds TT600 

Tradewinds Power Corp. $5,257.00 $5,257.00 $5,257.00 $5,257.00 

#75. 6 INCH MOBILE PUMP PACKAGE 

Godwin CD150M 

Godwin Pumps of America, Inc $37,650.00 $37,650.00 $37,650.00 $37,650.00 

Holland Pumps PT6TPC 

Holland Pump Company $39,550.00 $39,100.00 $39,100.00 $39,100.00 

Thompson 6JSCEN 

Thompson Pump & Manufacturing Co., Inc. $37,750.00 $37,750.00 $37,750.00 $37,750.00 

Tradewinds TPK064750 

Tradewinds Power Corp. $32,852.00 $32,852.00 $32,852.00 $32,852.00 
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Wacker Neuson APT6 

Kelly Tractor Co -- No bid --

Wacker Neuson Sales Americas LLC $34,250.00 

#76. AQUATIC WEED CUTTER WORKBOAT 

Weedoo TigerCat Workboat 

Weedoo Boats 

#77. AQUATIC HARVESTER WORKBOAT 

Weedoo Aqua Harvester 334 

Weedoo Boats 

$72,770.00 

$45,200.00 
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